CERTIFICATION OF CLERK

|, Brenda K. Wolf, the duly appointed, qualified, and Deputy City Clerk of
Manhattan, Kansas, do hereby certify that the foregoing Ordinance was duly
adopted at a meeting of the City of Manhattan, Kansas, held
on the 18" day of June, 2019, and that said Ordinance has been
compared by me with the original thereof on file and of record in my
office, is a true copy of the whole of said original.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have hereunto set my hand and the
seal of the City of Manhattan, Kansas, 19t day of June, 2019.

Brenda K. Wolf, CMC, Deputy City Clerk



Wolf
Brenda K. Wolf


AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 8 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES,
REGULATING FUEL GAS WORK WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY
INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE
“INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE” EDITION OF 2018, WITH CERTAIN
OMISSIONS, CHANGES AND ADDITIONS THERETO; AND REPEALING ALL

OF MANHATTAN, KANSAS;

[ORDINANCE]|NO. 7426

ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT HEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF MANHATTAN,

KANSAS:

SECTION 1. That Section 8-132 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Manhattan, Kansas, is

hereby amended to read as follows:

SECTION 2. That Section 8-138 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Manhattan, Kansas, is

Section 8-132. Adoption of the International Fuel Gas Code.

There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of regulating all fuel gas
work done or performed within the corporate city limits of the City of Manhattan,
Kansas that certain standard fuel gas code known as the International Fuel Gas
Code, 2018 Edition including appendices A, B, C and D as recommended by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW 6™ Floor, Washington,
DC, 20001, save and except such articles, sections, parts, or portions thereof as are
hereinafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than one (1) copy of
such publication shall be marked or stamped “Official Copy as adopted by
Ordinance No. 7426”, and shall be attached to a copy of this ordinance and filed
with the city clerk and open for inspection and available to the public at all
reasonable hours. All administrative departments of the city charged with
enforcement of this code shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of
official copies, similarly marked, as may be deemed expedient.

hereby amended to reads as follows:

Section 8-138 Amendments.
The International Fuel Gas Code, adopted by Section 8-132, is hereby changed,
altered, modified and otherwise amended as follows:

1. Section 101.1 of the International Fuel Gas Code is hereby changed to read as
follows:

Section 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code of
Manhattan, Kansas, hereafter referred to as “this code”.

2. Section 106.6.2 of the International Fuel Gas Code is hereby changed to read
as follows:



In The Matter of ORDINANCE NO. 7426 SUMMARY

STATE OF KANSAS, RILEY COUNTY, ss

ORDINANCE NO. 7426
o SUMMARY

“PUBLISHED IN THE MANHAT-
" TAN MERCURY ON JUNE 23,
2019
On June 18, 2019, the City of
 Manhattan, Kansas adopted the
following ordinance:
- AN ORDINANCE AMENDING
 CHAPTER 8 OF THE CODE
* OF ORDINANCES, REGULAT-
ING FUEL GAS WORK WITHIN
. THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF
THE CITY OF MANHATTAN,
KANSAS; INCORPORATING
BY REFERENCE THE “INTER-
. NATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE"
- EDITION OF 2018, WITH CER-
TAIN OMISSIONS, CHANGES
AND ADDITIONS THERETO;
~ AND REPEALING ALL ORDI-
NANCES IN CONFLICT HERE-
" WITH.

The Ordinance adopts the 2018
International Fuel Gas Code and
“makes certain amendments to
" that code as more specifically
- described in the ordinance. The
« complete text of the Ordinance
may be obtained or viewed free
of charge at the office of the
City Clerk, City Hall, 1101 Poy-
ntz Ave., Manhattan, KS 66502,
Monday — Friday, 8 a.m.—5 p.m.,
and is available for at least one
‘week following the publication
date of this summary at www.
cityofmhk.com. This Summary
certified to be legally accurate
and sufficient by Assistant City
Attorney Rachel Zenger.

Printer’s Fee § 61 ‘ ’ 6{

Payment Date

I, Robin Phelan being first duly sworn, depose and say:
That I am Advertising Director of The Manhattan Mercury,
a daily newspaper printed in the State of Kansas, and
published in and of general circulation in Riley County,
Kansas, with a general paid circulation on a daily basis in
Riley County, Kansas and that said newspaper is not a
trade, religious or fraternal publication. Said newspaper is
a daily published at least weekly 50 times a year; has been
so published continuously and uninterruptedly in said
county and state for a period of more than five years prior
to the first publication of said notice; and has been
admitted at the post office of Manhattan in said County as
second class matter. That the attached notice is a true copy
thereof and was published in the regular and entire issue of
said newspaper for one consecutive insertion the first
publication thereof being made as aforesaid on the 23rd day
of June, 2019 with subsequent publications being made on
the following dates:

On the day of , 2019

On the day of ;2019

On the day of , 2019
s

Tz |

Subscribed and sworn to before me this 7"1 L day

S~ VAL

, 2019.

Notary Public

Notary Seal

E 3 SAMANTHA FOSHA ’
Notary Public - State of Kansas
My Appt. Expires [0 ),5ﬂ7 (






susan.schinstock
File Attachment
Proof of Pub{MM-062319-Ord. No. 7426.pdf


Section 106.6.2 Fee Schedule. The fees for all fuel gas work requiring a permit
shall be $25.00.

For each re-inspection beyond the second re-inspection. $50.00

Each inspection which is not deemed ready for inspection at the scheduled time
shall be considered a failed inspection and subject to re-inspection. The re-
inspection fee shall be paid within 10 calendar days of the date of the inspection
causing the fee, and prior to a certificate of occupancy being issued for that
project. Subsequent inspections for that permitted project shall not be conducted
until all past due re-inspection fees have been paid. The Building Official shall
have the authority to waive re-inspection fees as deemed necessary.

3. Section 106.6.3 of the International Fuel Gas Code is hereby changed to read
as follows:

Section 106.6.3 Fee refunds. The code official shall authorize the refunding of
fees as follows:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or
collected.

2. Not more than 100% of the permit fee paid when no work has been done
under a permit issued in accordance with this code.

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid except upon
written application filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after
the date of fee payment.

4. Section 108.4 of the International Fuel Gas Code is hereby changed to read as
follows:

Section 108.4 Violation penalties. Any person who shall violate a provision
of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who
shall erect, install, alter or repair work in violation of the approved construction
documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate issued
under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable
by a fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500) or by imprisonment not
exceeding one hundred eighty days (180), or by both such fine and
imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues shall be deemed a separate
offense.

5. Section 108.5 of International Fuel Gas Code is hereby changed to read as
follows:

Section 108.5 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the code official, work
that is being done contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or
unsafe manner shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and



shall be given to the owner of the property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the
person doing the work. The notice shall state the conditions under which work
is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the code official shall not
be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any person
who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been served
with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform
to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less
than one hundred ($100) dollars or more than five hundred ($500) dollars.

6. Section 109 of the International Fuel Gas Code is hereby deleted.

7. Section 309.2 of the International Fuel Gas Code is hereby changed to read as
follows:

Section 309.2 Connections. Electrical connections between equipment and the
building wiring, including the grounding of the equipment, shall conform to the
National Electrical Code as adopted in Section 8-47 of the city Code of
Ordinances.

8.  Section 407.2 of the International Fuel Gas Code is hereby changed to read as
follows:

Section 407.2 Design and installation. Piping shall be supported with pipe
hooks, pipe straps, bands, brackets, hangers or building structural components,
suitable for the size of piping, of adequate strength and quality, and located at
intervals so as to prevent or damp out excessive vibration. Piping shall be
anchored to prevent undue strains on connected appliances and shall not be
supported by other piping. Pipe hangers and supports shall conform to the
requirements of MSS SP-58 and shall be spaced in accordance with Section
415. Supports, hangers and anchors shall be installed so as not to interfere with
the free expansion and contraction of the piping between anchors. All parts of
the supporting equipment shall be designed and installed so they will not be
disengaged by movements of the supported piping.

SECTION 3. Ordinance No. 7225 and all other ordinances, or portions thereof, in conflict
herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 4. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after January 1, 2020, and
its publication in the official city newspaper.



PASSED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF MANHATTAN, KANSAS,
THIS 18™ DAY OF JUNE, 2019.

T

Michael I{. Dodson, M¥yor

ATTEST:

MC, City Clerk



(PUBLISHED IN THE MANHATTAN MERCURY ON JUNE 23, 2019)

ORDINANCE NO. 7426 SUMMARY

On June 18, 2019, the City of Manhattan, Kansas adopted the following ordinance:
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 8 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES,
REGULATING FUEL GAS WORK WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY
OF MANHATTAN, KANSAS; INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE
“INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE” EDITION OF 2018, WITH CERTAIN
OMISSIONS, CHANGES AND ADDITIONS THERETO; AND REPEALING ALL
ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT HEREWITH.

The Ordinance adopts the 2018 International Fuel Gas Code and makes certain amendments to
that code as more specifically described in the ordinance. The complete text of the Ordinance may
be obtained or viewed free of charge at the office of the City Clerk, City Hall, 1101 Poyntz Ave.,
Manhattan, KS 66502, Monday — Friday, 8 a.m. — 5 p.m., and is available for at least one week
following the publication date of this summary at www.cityofmhk.com. This Summary certified
to be legally accurate and sufficient by Assistant City Attorney Rachel Zenger.

’{QM\.AJJMM

Assistant City Attoffiey ¥
Date certified: (- 1%~ 155



http://www.cityofmhk.com/



